

## Sludge Hauling Bid Tabulation

### North Wastewater Treatment Plant

When diesel price is:	Hazex Construction	Naas LLC	Alzey Express, Inc.
<b>\$1.76 - \$2.00</b>	\$ 8.43	\$ 10.61	\$ 25.95
<b>\$2.01 - \$2.25</b>	\$ 8.61	\$ 10.65	\$ 26.45
<b>\$2.26 - \$2.50</b>	\$ 8.80	\$ 10.69	\$ 26.95
<b>\$2.51 - \$2.75</b>	\$ 8.98	\$ 10.74	\$ 27.45
<b>\$2.76 - \$3.00</b>	\$ 9.16	\$ 10.80	\$ 27.95
<b>\$3.01 - \$3.50</b>	\$ 9.52	\$ 10.89	\$ 28.95

### South Wastewater Treatment Plant

When diesel price is:	Hazex Construction	Naas LLC	Alzey Express, Inc.
<b>\$1.76 - \$2.00</b>	\$ 8.65	\$ 15.83	no bid
<b>\$2.01 - \$2.25</b>	\$ 8.84	\$ 15.87	no bid
<b>\$2.26 - \$2.50</b>	\$ 9.03	\$ 15.91	no bid
<b>\$2.51 - \$2.75</b>	\$ 9.22	\$ 15.96	no bid
<b>\$2.76 - \$3.00</b>	\$ 9.41	\$ 16.04	no bid
<b>\$3.01 - \$3.50</b>	\$ 9.79	\$ 16.13	no bid

<b>Awarded vendor:</b>	Hazex Construction
------------------------	--------------------